
  

 
CLASS TEACHER 

 
Salary:    Main pay scale 
 
Contract Type:  Permanent 
 
Start Date:    1st September 2021 
 
Application Closing Date:  20th April, 2021  
 
Interview Date:   27th April, 2021 
 
Keeble Gateway Academy is a new academy, which opened in September 2019. In September 
2021, our Year 1 class will move to Year 2, and we want to find the perfect teacher for them! The 
Academy will grow, year on year and this is a brilliant opportunity to play a lead role in our 
developing team.  Our brand-new building opened in summer 2020, including state of the art 
facilities for Sport and ICT, a sensory room and immersive space, and a large school site including 
playing fields, MUGA and forest schools area.  
 
This is a key appointment for the academy. Our children and families have had an excellent start 
at Keeble – and we look forward to building on that in 2021/22. Your practice, ethos and approach 
to school life will shape the lives of our children, the school we are building and the future staff 
that are appointed. As such, it is key that: 
 

 Your priority in the classroom is building relationships with children; 
 Your values are aligned to our school values of love, kindness, aspiration and self-belief; 
 You enjoy teaching and are passionate about your career;  
 You are ready to play a leading role in school life; 
 You are committed to ensuring every child achieves their absolute potential, regardless of 

background or barriers;  
 You have exceptionally high expectations for your children; 
 You are an innovative practitioner, interested in using research to develop your practice; 
 You are committed to a team approach – being a small school, we all contribute and help 

each other across aspects of school life. 
 
This is a unique opportunity for career development. As the school grows, so will the opportunity 
to lead, develop and grow. We would love to appoint someone with an interest in leadership, 
either now or in future. An interest in leading mathematics would be beneficial. Please describe 
your leadership aspirations as part of your application.  
 
We are part of an excellent Multi Academy Trust, which values networking and support highly. If 
you are a less experienced teacher or leader, you will be excellently supported throughout. There 
is a high level of teaching assistant support across the school. 
 
If you would like to apply for this role, please look carefully at the following materials and complete 
the application form. 
 
Further information 
 
We will be holding Zoom sessions to meet interested candidates and answer questions about 
the role. To book onto a session, please contact Ginna Strudwick on 01845 448227 or 
admin@keeblegatewayacademy.org 
 

mailto:admin@keeblegatewayacademy.org


Further details are available from Hannah Burrell, Assistant Headteacher or Nikkie Beniams, 
Executive Headteacher of Keeble Gateway Academy. Please email 
n.beniams@elevatemat.org or call 01845 448227 for an informal discussion. 
 
Job Descriptions and application forms are available from the school website 
http://www.keeblegatewayacademy.org. Reference Number - REC/KEE/00000137  
 
How to apply 
 
Please return your completed application form to Mrs G Strudwick at 
admin@keeblegatewayacademy.org . Please ensure that all parts of the application are 
completed.  We do not accept CVs as part of the selection process. 
 
Keeble Gateway Academy is committed to safeguarding the welfare of children and young people 
and expects all staff and volunteers to share this commitment. The successful applicant will be 
required to undertake an Enhanced Disclosure via the DBS.  

http://www.keeblegatewayacademy.org/
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